Christine Vermeire
m

Van: Tom Declerck <T.Declerck@troostwijk.be>

Verzonden: dinsdag 1 juni 2021 15:14

Aan: Christine Vermeire

CC: Koen Grysolle; Birgit van Herck; Cédric Tilman

Onderwerp: FW: MSN 0110 Maintenance Statement -faling Aerocircular
Bijlagen: 20210601142131653.pdf

Geachte meester Vermeire,

In bijlage document van LHT BRU voor uitgevoerde werken.
mvg

Tom Declerck
Deskundige

Troostwijk NV
Desguinlei 22 bus 3
2018 Antwerpen (Belgium)

phone :+32(0)3 287 62 62

mobile : + 32 (0)492.275.440

e-mail : T.Declerck@troostwijkauctions.com
website: www.troostwijk.be

social:

Everything has value

Van: ROSS, ANDREW <andy.ross@Iht.dlh.de>

Verzonden: dinsdag 1 juni 2021 14:22

Aan: Tom Declerck <T.Declerck@troostwijk.be>

CC: REYMENANTS, RONNY <ronny.reymenants@lht.dih.de>
Onderwerp: MSN 0110 Maintenance Statement

Good Afternoon Tom
Please find the maintenance statement confirming the removal of remaining fuel on aircraft MSN 0110.

If you require any further information please let me know.

Best Regards

Andy Ross

Head of Production

Lufthansa Technik Brussels

Viiegveld building 117D

B-1820 Steenokkerzeel-Melsbroek, Belgium
Mob: +32 (0) 475 961934
Email:Andy.ross@lht.dih.de




Lufthansa Technik
Brussels

Vliiegveld, 117D, 1820 Steenokkerzeel, Belgium

To: Mr T Declerck From: Andy Ross
' Head of Production
Lufthansa Technik Brussels

Dear Sir

This to confirm that LHT BRU have performed AMM task 28-25-00-650-003A to drain
remaining fuel from the wing & center tasks on aircraft A320 MSN 0110 & that the tanks
can be considered Tactical Dry.

Best Regards

&

Andy Ross

Head of Production

Lufthansa Technik Brussels

Viiegveld building 117D

B-1820 Steenokkerzeel-Melsbroek, Belgium
Mob: +32 (0) 475 961934

Email:Andy.ross@iht.dih.de




Lufthansa Technik Brussels N.V.

Vliegveld, Bld 117D

1820 Steenokkerzeel - Melsbroek

Belgié

Tel.: 02 752 86 60

Fax.: 02 752 86 73

VAT BE 0463.480.945

Account: 826-0004154-97

IBAN: BE54 8260 0041 5497 BIC: DEUTBEBE

Lufthansa Technik
Brussels

FT. NV AEROCIRCULAR

p/a mrs C.Vermeire & R.Crivits
Ezelstraat 25

8000 Brugge

Belgié

To be mentioned in all correspondence

Invoice
Customer code Doc. number Date
Our ref FTACS/MTC20210601R00 R
Your ref A320 MSN 0110 Ostend VAT-No. BE 660.934.640 140000 2105040 I 27/05/2021
Article Description Unit  Quantity Unitprice % Amount VAT%
605050000003 Fixed price for performance of Maintenance Occ 1,000 7.400,000 7.400,00
Services on an A320-200 MSN 0110 A/C
registration D-AIPP at Ostend Airport
following Proposal
LHT/FTACS/MTC20210601R00
31/5/21 - 1/6/21
Subtotal 7.400,00
VAT
0,00 % Amount due 7.400,00
Base 7.400,00
VAT AMOUNT DUE EUR 7.400,00
Due Date 31/05/2021

Lufthansa Technik Brussels N.V.




FT. NV Aerocircular

Proposal to CUSTOMER:

For the Performance of: Maintenance Services on an A320-200
A/C MSN 0110 at Ostend Airport (BE)

Provider of services:

Lufthansa Technik Brussels NV

having its principal office at:

Vliegveld Building 117D

1820 Steenokkerzeel-Melsbroek
Belgium

(hereinafter referred to as "LHT Brussels)
holding EASA Part-145 approval certificate
no. DE.145.0001

VAT BE 0463.480.945

Document: 20210601R01

Date: 28-05-2021

Contact: Ronny Reymenants

Phone: +32 2 752 8667

Fax: +322 752 8673

Email: ronny.reymenants@lht.dlh.de

LHT/FTACS/MTC20210601R01
28/05/2021 Page 1 of 11



FT. NV Aerocircular

1.4 Charges

1.4.1Fixed price of: 7.400 €
(Seven Thousand Four Hundred EUR)
1.4.2 Additional Charges:

N/A in case of chares a new offer/Proposal has to be made and agreed by
both parties.

2. Component Management Services
2.1 Scope of Service

In case of need, LHT Brussels will order Rotable and repairable components directly
at the CUSTOMER s, responsible department. Consumable parts can be delivered
by the CUSTOMER or will be ordered by LHT Brussels in conjunction with
CUSTOMER's responsible department.

LHT/FTACS/MTC20210601R01
28/05/2021 Page 3 of 11



% Lufthansa Technik

FT. NV Aerocircular Brussels

4 Invoicing and Payment

4.1 Invoicing Details

Customer's Invoicing address and Details:

FT. NV Aerocircular

p/a mrs. Christine Vermeire en Rik Crivits
Ezelstraat 25

8000 Brugge

BTW : 0660.934.640

Address Bank Details LHT Brussels NV

Lufthansa Technik Brussels NV
Vliegveld Building 117D

1820 Melsbroek

Belgium

Bank Details LHT Brussels NV

DEUTSCHE BANK AG
Marnixlaan 17

B-1000 Brussels

Account number : 826-004154-97
IBAN : BE54 8260 0041 5497
BIC : DEUTBEBE

4.2 Fixed Prices

Fixed Price of 7.400€ has to be paid before Monday 315t of May 2021. Prove
of Payment has to be send via E-mail to ronny.reymenants@iht.dlh.de

LHT/FTACS/MTC20210601R01
28/05/2021 Page 5 of 11



FT. NV Aerocircular

Annex 1 to

Standard proposal For A/C Services

1.1 List of Aircraft

MSN 0110

1 N/A N/A 0110

#2 N/A N/A 0110

1.3 Maintenance Layover Time (slot)

LHT/FTACS/MTC20210601R01
28/05/2021

Page 7 of 11



FT. NV Aerocircular
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Place of Performa

Theﬁaeeof?etfsrmaneeuf&eMamtemceSemceshaﬂbeﬂmLHTmeeiaui:_tﬁ_ specified in

the Customer Agreement. Should the Customer Agreement specify no particular LHT service facility,

gmwimmmmmmmmea:mmwmﬁm aintenance Object.

ustomer’s Obligations

The Customer shall supply LHT with the Customer’s Working Equi 1an§mma§dammmsenthe

: mntenamemdrepaumstmynfmemm &‘;':n campleungme
ance Service mduglmg fimitation -all ' relevant tnmn manuals and special

documentation not at ).

e Dusomer e b supoy LT Ppiee, LHT Iy reducs fat Ihe Gusiomer supply any such documeris

aremcompf nsible or supply any sus men
%de uadowmeaﬁedmfammmmareasonaﬂe riod of time. Fgr

this 5 "dogtuments‘ include both printed documents and in all other format mcﬁudmg

ectronic formats
ﬁmeCustamerdoesnotcemplymmﬁremquestacccxﬂmgtoArbdeﬁ,Zm&mhme LHT is entitied to
terminate the Customer Agreement with immediate effect. In such case, LHT shall be entitled lo claim
mﬁ&rﬁx e Mail m&mmmmmtﬁwaspemdpmbmemnﬂemmm

5.1 523nd53danotm limit LHT's | contractual or claims.
at%yway onnz%ﬁxdsdosedbyLWmiamgtnﬂ\eCusmm

Customer shaﬁ freat as dential any inf
A% mﬁ ment itself as well as individual “provisions contained therein
gh ") Conﬁdem;at iﬂfm&nﬂ shall include, but not be limited to, the contents of
e negotia %x? greement, any business, tecmncal and stfategu: data
dxsdmedbyLHTm ubcm&aﬁmatangu?mfmanyreasm agtsanyandaisuch
information in oral noilmtedtopnces for maten and Maintenance
the scope of Maintenance Semces ed, legal provisions, tumaround times and man-

Services,
hours needed.

dgvety of each Maintenance Object and the Customers W Equipment to the Place of
Pemma QfmeMamtenameSemceshaﬁbeaHheCusmmesnskanéexpense unless

Rmm atcs
lhey haye been expkcwy and m writing declared as binding, redelivery dates indicated by LHT
bmdin? hall serve as information
g:d 4! hemmes aware itis kkety to miss the redeiwenj date, LHT will promptly notify the Customer.
Redelivery of the Mamteﬁame Qb;eat shau be effected free camier (FCA, Incoterms 292!3} the Place of
Performance excl packi
No!atermananewe'gt '3 notified the Customer that the Maintenance Service has been
completed or gi) the date of tarmnaﬁon f the Customer Agreement, whichever may occur first, the
Cmustomer shall exercise best efforts to immediately collect the Maintenance Object at the Place of
rmance
if the Customer fails to comply with Article 8.2, the Customer shall LHT for any costs and
ses it incurs in connection with the storage of the Maintenance according to LHT s then

current price list.

The Customer may nequestmatLH mCusiomermanalngfmsm;:mntofmeM

iject to ammer place as the in Am:le 8.1. Any s@eﬂt arrangements made Lz} LHT
n the name and on behatf of Custom Customer bear all shipping cost including

ihe mst for packing material

Warra
Adefencgpmmmybesubpctmm@ﬂttanseswﬂxnhme&vemn&sormﬂmmeﬂmusmdﬂgm
Hours after redelivery, whichever may occur first.

A warranty claim must be raised by Customer within m days after the defect has or could have

becomemasmabiyapparerﬂandl nms!baﬂﬁr aceefPexfmmancevammEQeﬂfecuve

part for inspection and repair within additional the warmranty claim has been raised. if a

defedmmanm-mm partafanamc the shaﬂgggaodfmﬁ’aagmhmtomdy
Customer ai accep for LHT

such defect in convenient for reasmab&y

LHT’s wanamy shaﬁ be excluded (i) if the defect has been caused because the Maintenance Object
has been altered, overha;ﬂed or repaired during the wamranty period by any parly other than LHT, or {ii)
if the defect has been caused by the Customers Workin b% Equipment or any material supﬁsed
Castomez or (iii) if the Customer has not taken all reasonable precautions to prevent an aggravation of

the deiecfor damage, w{w% if the Customer does not campay with apemm instructions provi
LHT or the respective ai of Component desugéa authonization. As a;h:\dg Custcmer is in defa
with its payment obli nons LHT may exgr;::se ils right of retention therefore refuse to meet
warranty claims until paymenthas been made

LHT/FTACS/MTC20210601R01

28/05/2021 Page 9 of 11



FT. NV Aerocircular

3. Property and IP Rights = ~
131Tﬂetodlmat&na§su edbyLHTunder&eCuﬁomerAgreemtshaﬁmamwﬁhL}ffuntﬁ
compl ;aymenwf mxmtsduemdmme(:ustomen\ eemthasbeene ected.
13.2 Title to all intellectual

property includi t:ademrks paﬁems
inventions, utility patents regmergggségn nghmg'm des;gn ngbts "1P R

or data (including but not limited fo plans, drawin ﬁttems or des;gns) LHT to Cusiomer
under the Customer Agreement, shall remain LHT ch is emmed to such IP

Rights
14. Lien and ﬂ‘ght of Retention
14.1 Praveﬁed Germman statute on rights in aircrafis (Geselz tiber Rechte an Luﬂiahrzeagen) does
mWLHThasbywmesfﬁ:eMaxMenameSemoepeﬁm:edam&acmai with respect to
enanceOhgecimxtsws@%yasweﬂasm@hrespedbnﬂxerﬁemofﬁustmrmhﬂ?s
wstadytosewteanydaimeﬂ_ﬂ agamsicustemeroutoformcannecnmmﬁame(}&stomer
Agreememasw&asmsemanydams&faﬁﬁa&sa&ﬂagamstcustmr Such n%t
be asserted for services pre performed or materials pr supplied and lien resmctm
claims resulting from a { relanms@é)ofl;ustomerand!)euisdmufﬁ\am»& andfor any of
its affiliates. contractual kenshaﬁenneLHTandfm of its affiliates to publicly offer the
Maintenance Object for sale no earlier than one month after advising the Customer af its intent to do
so. To eﬁect such sale LHT shaif not be required to obtain an enforceable fitle or to comply with the
142 Further, msb?gvmeﬁmeMMnmmSempWawwaMmsmmme
Maintenance Object in its custedy as well as with respect to any o items of Customer in LHT"
custody to secure any claims of LHT against Customer out of or in_connection with the Customer
Agreement as well as to secure an c&awnsafafﬂkaﬁesafLHTagmnstCustom Such right aswa&as
asei-aﬁn may aiso be asserted for services previo medcrmatanals ew su
The right of retention as well as a right to set off any due mofLHTagamstCu
Customer against LHT also be exercised with respect to claims mwbngﬁemacmt:acmal
relationship of Customer al Da:ﬁschel.uﬂmnsa&ﬁa for any of its affiliates.
143 LHT shaﬁ aisa have the right to cease any ongoing antenance Service without notice until all
ue under the Customer Am or any other contractual relationshi between Customer
nd LHT or Cu%cmer and Deutsche ansa AG and/or any of its affiliates have de.
- gmz%hmia ofthe E peanU the Custo obigﬁedm the custo
ng WS uro nion ustomer is obli e ms
clearance for i (to be defined as the e mto the customs te the uropean Union) and
expm‘! fo be asexztfmnﬁ}ecus&:m the Eur n ) of any a«mﬁ{orpaﬂs
) and an y gmds TheCusmm:sah &ed w:ﬂaaﬂex:sﬁ and e
the European Umon ass;gned an f will perform
netessarycustemsc!eammemmename orcsn halfoi T.In
these cases, the Customer is obli pmvsde LHT w:th all necessary information and
docume mm( specially any licenses regarding prohibitions and restrictions). LHT shall not
be liable for any delay due lo the late delivery of information anddacwneﬁtakon byﬂusmmemrdueto
delays in the customs clearance process. All duties and taxes that may occu mgomﬁanar
- E)}t{p&gﬁlg‘t (defined above}hawetabebmnebyme CustemerorwxﬁbechargedbyLHTto
L P! ause
Customer shall comp plicable domestic and forei ce requiremen
including icable U! rt faws and requiations (e. ﬂ-& Snd OFAC Sanchons xat;ons;
and those of other re!e fore&gn smsﬁms Upon LHT's ‘rcex)est Customer shall proi y provide
LHT with appropriate certifications as requed by such appli rt laws and regulations, or as
necessary to ensure continuing compliance with such laws and regu!anms
Agepﬁeable Law and Venue
17 1Tl and these Standard Terms and Conditions and any relationship with
imner that may arise therefrom shall be exciuswe&y sub;ect to and exclusively in
accomance with the faws of Belgium e:ec!udu%g conflict of laws rules. ‘fhe United Nations
Convention on the Intemnational Sale of Goods (CISG) shall not apply. In the event of a conflict between
the English and the ian meaning of any exgx;essms used in these Standard Terms and Conditions
or any part thereof the {egal meaning shall prevail.
17.2 The courls of Brussels, shaﬁhavemnsdimm In case of any claims asserted against LHT this
w sdiction shall be excluswe
18. Waiver of Sovereign immunity
HT and Customer agrees that Customer Agreement and an: no¥ legal relationship that may arise
mefefmm are commercial transactions and Customer undertakes not to claim any unmumty from suit,
- 2xeclmenm , pre-judgment or post-judgment attachment or other legal process in any jurisdictio
. Amendments
Any amendments to these Standard Terms and Conditions including this clause and the Customer
Agreement need to be agreed upon between LHT and the Customer in writing.

Lufthansa Technik Brussels N.V. GTC 23 March 2020

LHT/FTACS/MTC20210601R01
28/05/2021 Page 11 of 11



Christine Vermeire

#

Van: WOUTERS, RITA <rita.wouters@lht.dlh.de>

Verzonden: donderdag 27 mei 2021 13:58

Aan: REYMENANTS, RONNY; Christine Vermeire; 'Astrid Lescouhier | Crivits & Persyn'

cc: 'Rik Crivits | Crivits & Persyn’; VAN TRICHT, HAN; VAN EYCKEN, GERRIT;
PREUD'HOMME, RUDI; ROSS, ANDREW

Onderwerp: RE: Dringend - prijsaanvraag - FT. AEROCIRCULAR NV - OFFICIELE STUKKEN -
24924/161.2 -

Bijlagen: STC LT BRU 23MARCH2020.pdf; 2105040 - Aerocircular.pdf

Urgentie: Hoog

Geachte mevrouw Vermeire,

Gelieve in bijlage factuur 2105040 te willen vinden met vervaldag 31/05/21.
Graag ontvangen wij nog de getekende proposal.

Dank bij voorbaat.
Met vriendelijke groet,

Rita Wouters

Lufthansa Technik Brussels nv
B-1820 Steenokkerzeel-Melsbroek
t/+32 27528670

f/ +3227528673

personal/ rita.wouters@lht.dlh.de

GDPR Policy: https:/bit.ly/2JGG408

Lufthansa Technik Brussels NV, Viiegveld 117D, 1820 Steenokkerzeel, Belgié
Ondernemingsnummer: 0463.480.945, RPR Rechtbank van Koophandel, Brussel
Deutsche Bank AG Bijkantoor Brussel, IBAN BE54 8260 0041 5497

From: REYMENANTS, RONNY <ronny.reymenants@Iht.dlh.de>

Sent: Thursday 27 May 2021 12:57

To: Christine Vermeire <christine.vermeire@advocaat.be>; 'Astrid Lescouhier | Crivits & Persyn'
<Astrid.Lescouhier@crivitspersyn.be>

Cc: 'Rik Crivits | Crivits & Persyn' <Rik.Crivits@crivitspersyn.be>; VAN TRICHT, HAN <han.vantricht@Iht.dlh.de>; VAN
EYCKEN, GERRIT <gerrit.van.eycken@lht.dlh.de>; PREUD'HOMME, RUDI <rudi.preudhomme@Iht.dlh.de>; ROSS,
ANDREW <andy.ross@lht.dlh.de>; WOUTERS, RITA <rita.wouters@lht.dih.de>; kurt.van.dam@telenet.be

Subject: RE: Dringend - prijsaanvraag - FT. AEROCIRCULAR NV - OFFICIELE STUKKEN - 24924/161.2 -

Goede namiddag Mevrouw Vermeire,
In bijlage kan u onze proposal vinden ter ondertekening voor de uitvoering van de werken.
Kan u ons een getekende versie terugbezorgen, bedankt.

@ Rita: kan je aub een factuur opmaken voor de vaste prijs van 7.400€ en doorsturen naar de personen in deze
mail, bedankt.(vervaldag 31/05/2021)

Mvg,

Ronny Reymenants



